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Liquid Chlorinated sanitizer is an EPA approved chlorine 
based sanitizer made specifically for use in 3 sink 
systems as a final sanitizing step. This package includes 
an insert for use in a closed loop system with a 
proportioner. Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5%, Inert 
Ingredients 87.5%, Available Chlorine 11.9%. 

Features & Benefits 

Chlorinated sanitizer for 3 sink systems. 

With insert for closed loop system. 

EPA approved sanitizer. 

Item Number & Unit of Measure 

Item Number HIL0037006 
Unit of Measure 1 gal Bottle 

 
Specifications 

Color Light Colored 
Appearance Clear 
Fragrance Bleach 
Formula Type Liquid 
Requires Dispenser 
 
 

Yes 
Dilution Ratio 1-6OZ PER 10 

GALLONS OF 
WATER 

PH 12.00 - 14.00 

Non-Volatile Matter 
 

N/A 
EPA Registration # 148-1288-1658 

Safety 

See safety datasheet (if applicable) and product label for 
safety information, handling and proper use. 

Directions for Use 

/b> SANITIZATION OF NON POROUS FOOD CONTACT 
SURFACES>/b> RINSE METHOD>/b> # A solution of 100 
ppm available chlorine may be used in the sanitizing 
solution if a chlorine test kit is available. Solutions 
containing an initial concentration of 100 ppm available 
chlorine must be tested and adjusted periodically to 
insure that the available chlorine does not drop below 50 
ppm. Prepare a 100 ppm sanitizing solution by 
thoroughly mixing 1 fl. oz. of this product per 10 gallons 
of water. If no test kit is available, prepare a sanitizing 
solution by thoroughly mixing 2 fl. oz. of this product 
with 10 gallons of water to provide approximately 200 
ppm available chlorine by weight. Clean equipment 
surfaces in the normal manner. Prior to use, rinse all 
surfaces thoroughly with the sanitizing solution, 
maintaining contact with the sanitizer for at least 2 
minutes. If solution contains less than 50 ppm available 
chlorine, as determined by a suitable test kit, either 
discard the solution or add sufficient product to 
reestablish a 200 ppm residual. Do not rinse equipment 
with water after treatment and do not soak equipment 
overnight. Sanitizers used in automated systems may be 
used for general cleaning but may not be reused for 
sanitizing purposes. IMMERSION METHOD>/b> # A 
solution of 100 ppm available chlorine may be used in 
the sanitizing solution if a chlorine test kit is available. 
Solutions containing an initial concentration of 100 ppm 
available chlorine must be tested and adjusted 
periodically to insure that the available chlorine does not 
drop below 50 ppm. Prepare a 100 ppm sanitizing 
solution by thoroughly mixing 1 fl. oz. of this product per 
10 gallons of water. If no test kit is available, prepare a 
sanitizing solution by thoroughly mixing 2 fl. oz. of this 
product per 10 gallons of water to provide approximately 
200 ppm available chlorine by weight. Clean equipment 
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in the normal manner. Prior to use, immerse equipment 
in the sanitizing solution for at least 2 minutes and allow 
the sanitizer to drain. If solution contains less than 50 
ppm available chlorine, as determined by a suitable test 
kit, either discard the solution or add sufficient product 
to reestablish a 200 ppm residual. Do not rinse 
equipment with water after treatment. Sanitizers used in 
automated systems may be used for general cleaning 
but may not be reused for sanitizing purposes. 
FLOW/PRESSURE METHOD>/b> # Disassemble 
equipment and thoroughly clean after use. Assemble 
equipment in operating position prior to use. Prepare a 
volume of 200 ppm available chlorine sanitizing solution 
equal to 110% of volume capacity of the equipment by 
mixing the product in a ratio of 2 fl. oz. product per 10 
gallons of water. Pump solution through the system until 
full flow is obtained at all extremities, the system is 
completely filled with the sanitizer and all air is removed 
from the system. Close drain valves and hold under 
pressure for at least 2 minutes to insure contact with all 
internal surfaces. Remove some cleaning solution from 
drain valve and test with a chlorine test kit. Repeat entire 
cleaning/sanitizing process if effluent contains less than 
50 ppm available chlorine. CLEAN-IN-PLACE 
METHOD>/b> # Thoroughly clean equipment after use. 
Prepare a volume of 200 ppm available chlorine 
sanitizing solution equal to 110% of volume capacity of 
the equipment by mixing the product in a ratio of 2 fl. oz. 
product per 10 gallons of water. Pump solution through 
the system until full flow is obtained at all extremities, 
the system is completely filled with the sanitizer and all 
air is removed from the system. Close drain valves and 
hold under pressure for at least 10 minutes to insure 
contact with all internal surfaces. Remove some 
cleaning solution from drain valve and test with a 
chlorine test kit. Repeat entire cleaning/sanitizing 
process if effluent contains less than 50 ppm available 
chlorine. SPRAY/FOG METHOD>/b> # Preclean all 
surfaces after use. Use a 200 ppm available chlorine 
solution to control bacteria, mold or fungi and a 600 
ppm solution to control bacteriophage. Prepare a 200 
ppm sanitizing solution of sufficient size by thoroughly 
mixing this product in a ratio of 2 fl. oz. product per 10 
gallons of water. Prepare a 600 ppm solution by 

thoroughly mixing the product in a ratio of 6 fl. oz. per 10 
gallons of water. Use spray or fogging equipment which 
can resist hypochlorite solutions. Always empty and 
rinse spray/fog equipment with potable water after use. 
Thoroughly spray or fog all surfaces until wet, allowing 
excess sanitizer to drain. Vacate area for at least 2 
hours. Prior to using equipment, rinse all surfaces 
treated with a 600 ppm solution with a 200 ppm 
available chlorine solution. Insert: SANITIZATION OF 
POROUS FOOD CONTACT SURFACES>/b> RINSE 
METHOD>/b> # Prepare a 600 ppm solution by 
thoroughly mixing 6 fl. oz. of this product with 10 gallons 
of water. Clean surfaces in the normal manner. Rinse all 
surfaces thoroughly with the 600 ppm solution, 
maintaining contact with the sanitizer for at least 2 
minutes. Prepare a 200 ppm sanitizing solution by 
thoroughly mixing 2 fl. oz. of this product with 10 gallons 
of water. Prior to using equipment, rinse all surfaces 
thoroughly with a 200 ppm available chlorine solution. 
Do not rinse and do not soak equipment overnight. 
IMMERSION METHOD>/b> # Prepare a 600 ppm 
solution by thoroughly mixing in an immersion tank 6 fl. 
oz. of this product with 10 gallons of water. Clean 
equipment in the normal manner. Immerse equipment in 
the 600 ppm solution for at least 2 minutes. Prepare a 
200 ppm sanitizing solution by thoroughly mixing 2 fl. 
oz. of this product with 10 gallons of water. Prior to 
using equipment, immerse rinse all surfaces in a 200 
ppm available chlorine solution. Do not rinse or soak 
equipment overnight. SPRAY/FOG METHOD>/b> # 
Preclean all surfaces after use. Prepare a 600 ppm 
available chlorine sanitizing solution of sufficient size by 
thoroughly mixing this product in a ratio of 6 fl. oz. 
product per 10 gallons of water. Use spray or fogging 
equipment which can resist hypochlorite solutions. 
Always empty and rinse spray/fog equipment with 
potable water after use. Thoroughly spray or fog all 
surfaces until wet, allowing excess sanitizer to drain. 
Vacate area for at least 2 hours. Prior to using 
equipment, rinse all surfaces with a 200 ppm solution. 
Prepare a 200 ppm sanitizing solution by thoroughly 
mixing 2 fl. oz. of this product with 10 gallons of water. 
LAUNDRY SANITIZERS>/b> HOUSEHOLD LAUNDRY 
SANITIZERS>/b> IN SOAKING SUDS>/b> -- Thoroughly 
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mix 2 fl. oz. of this product per 10 gallons of wash water 
to provide 200 ppm available chlorine. Wait 5 minutes, 
then add soap or detergent. Immerse laundry for at least 
11 minutes prior to starting the wash/rinse cycle. IN 
WASHING SUDS>/b> -- Thoroughly mix 2 fl. oz. of this 
product to 10 gallons of wash water containing clothes 
to provide 200 ppm available chlorine. Wait 5 minutes, 
then add soap or detergent and start the wash/rinse 
cycle. COMMERCIAL LAUNDRY SANITIZERS>/b> # Wet 
fabrics or clothes should be spun dry prior to 
sanitization. Thoroughly mix 2 fl. oz. of this product to 
10 gallons of water to provide 200 ppm available 
chlorine. Promptly after mixing the sanitizer, add the 
solution into the prewash prior to washing 
fabrics/clothes in the regular wash cycle with a good 
detergent. Test the level of available chlorine if solution 
has been allowed to stand. Add more of this product if 
the available chlorine level has dropped below 200 ppm. 
>SANITIZATION OF NON POROUS NON-FOOD CONTACT 
SURFACES>/b> >RINSE METHOD>/b> # Prepare a 
sanitizing solution by thoroughly mixing 2 fl. oz. of this 
product with 10 gallons of water to provide 
approximately 200 ppm available chlorine by weight. 
Clean equipment surfaces in the normal manner. Prior to 
use, rinse all surfaces thoroughly with the sanitizing 
solution, maintaining contact for at least 2 minutes. Do 
not rinse equipment with water after treatment and do 
not soak equipment overnight. >IMMERSION 
METHOD>/b> # Prepare a sanitizing solution by 
thoroughly mixing, in an immersion tank, 2 fl. oz. of this 
product with 10 gallons of water to provide 
approximately 200 ppm available chlorine by weight. 
Clean equipment in the normal manner. Prior to use, 
immerse equipment in the sanitizing solution for at least 
2 minutes and allow the sanitizer to drain. Do not rinse 
equipment with water after treatment. >SPRAY/FOG 
METHOD>/b> # Preclean all surfaces after use. Prepare 
a 200 ppm available chlorine sanitizing solution of 
sufficient size by thoroughly mixing the product in a ratio 
of 2 fl. oz. product per 10 gallons of water. Use spray or 
fogging equipment which can resist hypochlorite 
solutions. Prior to using equipment, thoroughly spray or 
fog all surfaces until wet, allowing excess sanitizer to 
drain. Vacate for at least 2 hours. 

 

 

 


